EXHIBIT A

The Fisher . TGF
. . Burton Lizzette Enterprises
Lowest Bid Per Site= [ | Company | Medina & Co. ne.
Fort Sheridan Parade Grounds
Year 1 $20,300.00 $ 43,120.00
Year 2 $20,300.00 $ 43,120.00 NO BID
Year 3 $20,300.00 $ 43,120.00
Total Bid for Site $60,900.00 $129,360.00
Fort Sheridan Cemetery
Year 1 $11,900.00 $ 5,880.00
Year 2 $11,900.00 $ 5,880.00 NO BID
Year 3 $11,900.00 $ 5,880.00
Total Bid for Site $35,700.00 $17,640.00
General Offices
Year 1 $ 3,780.00 $ 2,646.00 $ 3,900.00
Year 2 $ 3,780.00 $ 2,646.00 $ 3,900.00
Year 3 $ 3,780.00 $ 2,646.00 $ 4,017.00
Total Bid for Site $11,340.00 $ 7,938.00 $11,817.00
Hastings Lake
Year 1 $ 6,300.00 $ 6,272.00
Year 2 $ 6,300.00 $ 6,272.00
Year 3 $ 6,300.00 $ 6,272.00 NO BID
Total Bid for Site $18,900.00 $18,816.00
Heron Creek
Year 1 $ 6,580.00 $ 2,646.00 $ 3,800.00
Year 2 $ 6,580.00 $ 2,646.00 $ 3,800.00
Year 3 $ 6,580.00 $ 2,646.00 $ 3,914.00
Total Bid for Site $19,740.00 $ 7,938.00 $11,514.00
Lakewood
Year 1 $29,960.00 $ 50,754.20
Year 2 $29,960.00 $ 50,754.20 NO BID
Year 3 $29,960.00 $ 50,754.20
Total Bid for Site $89,880.00 $152,262.60
Van Patten Woods
Year 1 $23,520.00 $20,909.00
Year 2 $23,520.00 $20,909.00
Year 3 NO BID $23,520.00 $21,536.27
Total Bid for Site $70,560.00 $63,354.27




